OFFICIAL

OFFICIAL

OFFICIAL
	[image: ]
	
Freedom of Information Response
Our reference:  FOI 24-2983
Responded to:  19 December 2024


Your recent request for information is replicated below, together with our response.
How many requests for bonus payments have been made since 2013 (as per section 4.7 of the PNB, covered in 4.12- Bonus payment - £50-£500 (at the discretion of the chief constable)).
In addition, how many of these requests have been granted and what has been the financial amount of each of these.
Finally, what if any criteria these are measured against in the decision making process.
Prior to 2021 I regret to inform you that Police Scotland do not hold all the information you have requested and in terms of Section 17 of the Act, this letter represents a formal notice that information is not held.
By way of explanation, these records have been destroyed in line with the current force retention policy.  
To be of assistance, I have provided information below from 2021 onwards. 
2021 – 152 Officers Received a payment 
£7,600 Total Payments paid out for the year
Demanding tasks - 6
Unpleasant tasks – 79
Important tasks - 2
2022 – 168 Officers Received a payment 
£8,400 Total Payments paid out for the year
Demanding tasks - 15
Unpleasant tasks – 69
Important tasks - 0
2023 – 287 Officers Received a payment 
£15,000 Total Payments paid out for the year 
Demanding tasks - 9
Unpleasant tasks – 50
Important tasks - 2
2024 (so far) – 224 Officers Received a payment 
£12,250 Total Payments paid out for the year 
Demanding tasks - 6
Unpleasant tasks - 81
Important tasks – 0
The nomination forms can have up to 6 nominated Officers and all nominations that are presented to the panel are decided on case by case scenarios. 
The panel is made up of a Chief Inspector, an Inspector and a member of the Awards and Ceremonies Unit. 
The criteria is as follows:
Outstandingly Unpleasant 
i.e. handling of decomposing bodies or body parts as a result of serious/fatal road crashes, fatal accidents or crime scenes.  
Outstandingly Demanding 
i.e. other operational incidents where exceptional circumstances and demands on the individual have been encountered successfully and resolved e.g. preservation of life, hostage incidents, difficult search conditions, isolated or continual extended periods of surveillance.
Outstandingly Important Nature 
i.e. producing specific work outcomes of an exceptionally high standard through direct personal effort and commitment resulting in positive measurable output, either in terms of financial saving or enhanced operational performance
If you require any further assistance, please contact us quoting the reference above.
You can request a review of this response within the next 40 working days by email or by letter (Information Management - FOI, Police Scotland, Clyde Gateway, 2 French Street, Dalmarnock, G40 4EH).  Requests must include the reason for your dissatisfaction.
If you remain dissatisfied following our review response, you can appeal to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner (OSIC) within 6 months - online, by email or by letter (OSIC, Kinburn Castle, Doubledykes Road, St Andrews, KY16 9DS).
Following an OSIC appeal, you can appeal to the Court of Session on a point of law only. 
This response will be added to our Disclosure Log in seven days' time.
Every effort has been taken to ensure our response is as accessible as possible. If you require this response to be provided in an alternative format, please let us know.
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