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Freedom of Information Response
Our reference:  FOI 25-0311
Responded to:  xx May 2025


Your recent request for information is replicated below, together with our response.
1. What specific guidance and training materials are being provided to officers and staff regarding the Hate Crime and Public Order (Scotland) Act 2021, particularly concerning the identification, recording, and investigation of hate crimes?
The information sought is held by Police Scotland, but I am refusing to provide it in terms of section 16(1) of the Act on the basis that the section 25(1) exemption applies:
“Information which the applicant can reasonably obtain other than by requesting it […] is exempt information”.
The information sought is publicly available in our Responding to Hate SOP.

2. How does the guidance address the balance between protecting individuals from hate crimes and preserving freedom of expression, especially regarding the recording and investigation of 'non-crime hate incidents’?
3. What are the criteria for determining whether an incident is classified as a hate crime or a non-crime hate incident? Please provide detailed information on the thresholds and factors considered in making this distinction.
The Scottish Crime Recording Standard (SCRS) provides a framework for the recording and counting of crimes in Scotland. It is overseen by the Scottish Crime Recording Board (SCRB) and aims to ensure uniformity in crime recording practices across the country, focussing on a victim orientated approach. The SCRS was introduced in 2004 to enhance the accuracy and consistency of crime data recorded by the Police Service of Scotland. 



4. How many hate crimes and non-crime hate incidents have been recorded since the implementation of the Act, disaggregated by protected characteristic and type of offence?
In response to this question please see the tables below.  Please note the caveats at the bottom of the tables.
	Category
	Number

	Number of non-crime hate incidents
	898

	Number of hate crimes
	7812



	Aggravators
	Number

	Race
	4764

	Religion
	509

	Disability
	992

	Sexual Orientation
	1851

	Transgender
	172

	Age
	57

	Variations In Sex Characteristics
	12


All statistics are provisional and should be treated as management information. 
Data was extracted from Police Scotland systems and are correct as of 16/04/2025
The number of hate crimes are a count of unique hate crimes. 
Multiple aggravators can be added to the one hate crime.
Due to different sources of data being used, and different methodology/counting rules, comparison of recorded hates crimes from 1 April 2024 with recorded hate crimes prior to 1 April 2024 would not be advised.  Any comparison of the two datasets should be carried out with caution.



5. What is the process for reviewing and handling complaints related to the recording of non-crime hate incidents? How are individuals notified if a non-crime hate incident has been recorded against them?
The information sought is held by Police Scotland, but I am refusing to provide it in terms of section 16(1) of the Act on the basis that the section 25(1) exemption applies:
“Information which the applicant can reasonably obtain other than by requesting it […] is exempt information”.
The information sought is publicly available in our Complaints About the Police SOP. 
In terms of notification, in line with page 21 of the Responding to Hate SOP, the “other party’s” details will not routinely be recorded. They should only be recorded in exceptional circumstances where the additional threshold has been met that the officers/staff believe there is a real risk of significant harm to individuals or groups”.

6. What are the policies and procedures for disclosing information about non-crime hate incidents in enhanced criminal record certificates (ECRCs)? Please provide specific details on the factors considered in making disclosure decisions.
The information sought is not held by Police Scotland and section 17 of the Act therefore applies.
Police Scotland does not hold any polices or procedures relating to the disclosure of non-crime hate incidents within enhanced record certificates. You may wish to direct your request to Disclosure Scotland. 

7. What steps are being taken to ensure that the recording and investigation of hate crimes, including non-crime hate incidents, comply with the Human Rights Act 1998, particularly Article 10 (freedom of expression)?
Please see Section 4 within the Responding to Hate SOP, linked above. 



8. What measures are in place to evaluate the effectiveness of the Hate Crime and Public Order (Scotland) Act 2021 in reducing hate crimes and protecting vulnerable groups? What data is being collected and analysed to assess the Act's impact?
The information sought is not held by Police Scotland and section 17 of the Act therefore applies.
By way of explanation, the Hate Crime and Public Order (Scotland) Act 2021, is Scottish Government legislation. Police Scotland does not hold any information relating to the effectiveness of the Act. You may wish to direct your question to the Scottish Government.

If you require any further assistance, please contact us quoting the reference above.
You can request a review of this response within the next 40 working days by email or by letter (Information Management - FOI, Police Scotland, Clyde Gateway, 2 French Street, Dalmarnock, G40 4EH).  Requests must include the reason for your dissatisfaction.
If you remain dissatisfied following our review response, you can appeal to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner (OSIC) within 6 months - online, by email or by letter (OSIC, Kinburn Castle, Doubledykes Road, St Andrews, KY16 9DS).
Following an OSIC appeal, you can appeal to the Court of Session on a point of law only. 
This response will be added to our Disclosure Log in seven days' time.
Every effort has been taken to ensure our response is as accessible as possible. If you require this response to be provided in an alternative format, please let us know.
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