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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (SCOTLAND) ACT 2002  
 
I refer to your recent request for information which has been handled in accordance with 
the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002. 
 
For ease of reference, your request is replicated below together with the response. 

1) From 1st January 2022 to 30th June 2022 how many incidents of 'sextortion' - 
i.e. the practice of extorting money or sexual favours from someone by 
threatening to reveal evidence of their sexual activity - were reported to your 
force? 
 

2) Of these, how many resulted in prosecution; and, of those that were 
prosecuted, how many resulted in a conviction [if you hold this information]? 
 

3) Please provide me with the same information for the calendar years 2021, 
2020, 2019, 2018 and 2017. 
 

4) Please provide me with copies of the first 3 MOs that relate to sextortion that 
were logged in 2022. 

Having considered your request in terms of the Act, I regret to inform you that I am unable 
to provide you with the precise and specific information you have requested, as it would 
prove too costly to do so within the context of the fee regulations.  
 
As you may be aware the current cost threshold is £600 and I estimate that it would cost 
well in excess of this amount to process your request. 
 
As such, and in terms of Section 16(4) of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 
where Section 12(1) of the Act (Excessive Cost of Compliance) has been applied, this 
represents a refusal notice for the information sought.  
 
By way of explanation, Police Scotland record crimes using the Scottish Government 
Justice Department crime classification codes and are not thereafter sub-categorised.  
 
In this instance, I’m afraid that there is no offence classification specific to sextortion as 
outlined in your request. Such offences could be recorded under more general 
classifications such as Fraud, Threats & Extortion, Disclosure of Images etc. The only way 
to determine whether any reports were relevant to your request, would be to carry out case 
by case assessment of all potentially relevant crime reports. This would involve individually 
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examining thousands of crime reports and this is an exercise which I estimate would far 
exceed the cost limit set out in the Fees Regulations.  
 
However, by way of assistance I can advise that some specific analysis has been 
conducted (not related to FOI) in order to attempt to gather some data regarding what 
could be referred to as ‘sextortion’.  
 
On that basis, I can provide you with the following recorded crime data which is the result 
of that exercise - although I would stress that the data is heavily caveated. 
 
Additionally, please be advised that the data provided below is subject to change.  The 
data may differ from any previously published data, this can be due in part to any non-
recent reports that may have been received, any ongoing investigation or when reports are 
uploaded to the crime system. 

I can advise that between 01 January and 30 June 2022, 103 crimes that could be 
considered “sextortion” were identified. 

The table below provides information details the number of crimes that could be identified 
as “sextortion” for the years 2019, 2020 and 2021. 
 
Please note that this table does not contain information prior to 2019.  Additionally, this 
data does not cover N Division from July 2020 onward. Finally, data is categorised on a 
delay. July is the most recent and complete month available therefore data has been 
provided up to 31 July 2022.  
 

Year 2019 2020 2021 

Month  

January 17 29 69 

February 13 34 54 

March 14 29 60 

April 27 34 44 

May 21 28 57 

June 15 39 54 

July 22 40 94 

August 23 36 77 

 
Please find the requested MO descriptions below: 
 

MO Description 

1. Unknown suspect did attempt to extort money from complainer and send 
indecent images of complainer to family. 

1. Did engage in consensual sexual conversation and did talk complainer into 
carrying out a sexual act on skype. 2. Record same without knowledge of 
complainer, demand a sum of money and threaten to post same to friends. 



OFFICIAL 

 

scotland.police.uk                 @PoliceScotland                  PoliceScotland 
 

OFFICIAL 

 
Finally, in regard to prosecutions, Police Scotland does not hold prosecution information. 
As such, in terms of Section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002, this 
represents a notice that the information you seek is not held by Police Scotland. 
 
You may wish to contact the Crown Office and Procurator Fiscals Service (COPFS) which 
holds conviction information for Scotland. A request can be submitted to COPFS via email 
using the following address foi@copfs.gsi.gov.uk 
 
With respect to all of the information provided above please note the below methodology 
and limitations/caveats. 
 
 
Methodology 
 
This data is based upon Police Scotland recorded crime data and was extracted based 
upon having a “cybercrime” aggravator. This data was then collated and categorised 
based upon the available information for each crime and professional judgement. The data 
provided contains all recorded crimes that are determined to be an instance of “sextortion”, 
also known as webcam extortion.  
 
Instances of sextortion were deemed to be any instances of sexual material or information 
(images, videos, written communications, personal details) being obtained and used to 
extort the victim, whether for money, sexual acts or any other demand.  
 
Limitations/Caveats 
 

 These are not official statistics. 

 This data gathering process began in January 2019. As such, data prior to this point 
cannot be provided within the 40 hour time limit.  

 Police Scotland does not have a single unified crime recording system and as such 
this data is gathered from legacy police crime systems.  

 This data may contain errors as a result of variations in amounts of information 
provided for each recorded crime, errors in original recording of crimes, changes in 
methodology, or errors in the manual assessment of crimes.  

 Key word searches were based upon the Crime Method summary. These 
summaries are short and do not contain full details of the crime.  

 Data only includes crimes marked with the “cybercrime” aggravator and as such 
cannot account for instances of sextortion which have not received this marking. 

 The years relate to calendar year and not financial year. 

 We do not hold a summary of each recorded crime including outcome. 
 
Should you require any further assistance please contact Information Management quoting 
the reference number given. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the way in which Police Scotland has dealt with your request, 
you are entitled, in the first instance, to request a review of our actions and decisions. 

1) you did attempt to gain money by means of extortion 2) deleted 3) record the 
complainer engaging in an intimate act 4) threaten to disclose an intimate image 
of the complainer 

mailto:foi@copfs.gsi.gov.uk


OFFICIAL 

 

scotland.police.uk                 @PoliceScotland                  PoliceScotland 
 

OFFICIAL 

 
Your request must specify the matter which gives rise to your dissatisfaction and it must be 
submitted within 40 working days of receiving this response - either by email to 
foi@scotland.police.uk or by post to Information Management (Disclosure), Police Scotland, 
Clyde Gateway, 2 French Street, Dalmarnock, G40 4EH. 
 
If you remain dissatisfied following the outcome of that review, you are thereafter entitled to 
apply to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner within six months for a decision.  
You can apply online, by email to enquiries@itspublicknowledge.info or by post to Office of 
the Scottish Information Commissioner, Kinburn Castle, Doubledykes Road, St Andrews, 
Fife, KY16 9DS. 
 
Should you wish to appeal against the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner's 
decision, there is an appeal to the Court of Session on a point of law only. 
 
As part of our commitment to demonstrate openness and transparency in respect of the 
information we hold, an anonymised version of this response will be posted to the Police 
Scotland Freedom of Information Disclosure Log in seven days' time. 
 

mailto:foi@scotland.police.uk
http://www.itspublicknowledge.info/Appeal
mailto:enquiries@itspublicknowledge.info
http://www.scotland.police.uk/access-to-information/freedom-of-information/disclosure-log

