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Freedom of Information Response
Our reference:  FOI 25-1995
Responded to: 11th September 2025


Your recent request for information is replicated below, together with our response.
Can you please tell me, of all those who police officers who received a promotion in the last five years:
a) what the average score was at the most recent point of measurement on aptitude tests, as broken down by (1) sex and (2) ethnicity?
Unfortunately, I regret to inform you that I estimate it would cost well in excess of the current FOI cost threshold of £600 to process your request.  I am therefore refusing to provide the information sought in terms of section 12(1) of the Act - Excessive Cost of Compliance.
By way of explanation, whilst our Promotions team do record individual aptitude scores, they do not hold a compiled average, broken down by either sex or ethnicity. 
The scoring framework has varied over the last five years, therefore scores have not been recorded nor reported in a consistent format which would allow for meaningful comparison. 
Thus, the only way to provide an accurate response to your request would be to manually review and calculate each individual set of assessment results; given the significant volume of results that would be required to be read through for the five-year period specified, this exercise would far exceed the cost limit set out in the Fees Regulations. 

b) what the average years of employment was [at the point of promotion], also by (1) sex and (2) ethnicity?
First and foremost, please note that the average length of service has been calculated regardless of rank for all promotions during the five-year requested reporting periods. 
The promotions for the reporting period 01/04/2024 to 31/03/2025 are currently being analysed as part of the 2024/2025 Employment Monitoring Report and are therefore not yet available. 
For additional insight into length of service by each of the protected characteristics, you may also wish to refer to the Equality and Diversity Employment Monitoring Reports for the years 2024, 2022 and 2020 on the Police Scotland Website (Strategic Planning - Police Scotland). 
The first table below details the average years of employment at the point of promotion (temporary and substantive), for all police officers broken down by sex, over the last five years, inclusive:
	Reporting Period
	Male
	Female
	Overall

	01/04/2023 - 31/03/2024
	17 years
	17 years
	17 years

	01/04/2022 - 31/03/2023
	17 years
	17 years
	17 years

	01/04/2021 - 31/03/2022
	17 years
	17 years
	17 years

	01/04/2020 - 21/03/2021
	16 years
	16 years
	16 years

	01/04/2019 - 31/03/2020
	16 years
	16 years
	16 years



The second table at the bottom of the document details the average years of employment at the point of promotion (temporary and substantive), for all police officers broken down by ethnicity, over the last five years, inclusive.
It is important to note that the ethnic origin categories have been categorised in the following way due to some of them having very small numbers:
· BME - Mixed or Multiple Ethnic Group, Asian Pakistani, Asian Indian, Asian Bangladeshi, Asian Chinese, Asian Other, African, African Other, Caribbean, Black, Caribbean or Black Other, Arab and Other Ethnic Group. 
· White Minority - White Irish, White Gypsy/Traveller, White Polish and White Other.
· [bookmark: _Toc394043181]All Other White British - White English, White Northern Irish, White Welsh and White Other British.

c) what the average number of arrests made was, also by (1) sex and (2) ethnicity?
Unfortunately, again I estimate that it would cost well in excess of the current FOI cost threshold of £600 to process your request.  I am therefore refusing to provide the information sought in terms of section 12(1) of the Act - Excessive Cost of Compliance.
To explain, the number of arrests made per officer is not a metric that is measured nor monitored by Police Scotland. Therefore, the only way to provide an accurate response to your request for an average number of arrests made would be to manually retrieve and review the notebooks of every single police officer who received a promotion across Scotland over the five-year period specified. 
Given the volume of material that would be required to be read through and collated to calculate an overall average in the first instance, then to calculate separate averages dependent upon officer sex and officer ethnicity, this exercise would thus far exceed the cost limit set out in the Fees Regulations.  


If you require any further assistance, please contact us quoting the reference above.
You can request a review of this response within the next 40 working days by email or by letter (Information Management - FOI, Police Scotland, Clyde Gateway, 2 French Street, Dalmarnock, G40 4EH).  Requests must include the reason for your dissatisfaction.
If you remain dissatisfied following our review response, you can appeal to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner (OSIC) within 6 months - online, by email or by letter (OSIC, Kinburn Castle, Doubledykes Road, St Andrews, KY16 9DS).
Following an OSIC appeal, you can appeal to the Court of Session on a point of law only. 
This response will be added to our Disclosure Log in seven days' time.
Every effort has been taken to ensure our response is as accessible as possible. If you require this response to be provided in an alternative format, please let us know.
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	Reporting Period
	White Scottish
	Other White British
	White Minority
	BME
	Choose not  to Disclose
	Not Recorded

	01/04/2023 - 31/03/2024
	17 years
	16 years
	15 years
	17 years
	17 years
	n/a

	01/04/2022 - 31/03/2023
	17 years
	16 years
	17 years
	16 years
	17 years
	14 years

	01/04/2021 - 31/03/2022
	17 years
	15 years
	18 years
	18 years
	16 years 
	13 years

	01/04/2020 - 21/03/2021
	16 years
	14 years
	15 years
	16 years
	16 years
	n/a

	01/04/2019 - 31/03/2020
	16 years
	14 years
	15 years
	16 years
	16 years
	11 years
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