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Freedom of Information Response
Our reference:  FOI 25-3497
Responded to:  01 December 2025


Your recent request for information is replicated below, together with our response.
1. The total number of SARs received by Police Scotland in each month from January 2023 to the most recent complete month available.
The table below details Subject Access Requests (SARs) received by Police Scotland, broken down by month:
	Year/ Month
	2023
	2024
	2025

	January 
	579
	662
	804

	February
	601
	619
	794

	March
	696
	634
	817

	April
	592
	631
	726

	May
	674
	545
	795

	June
	670
	707
	775

	July
	562
	715
	836

	August
	706
	858
	788

	September
	620
	793
	791

	October
	575
	810
	830

	November
	589
	725
	~

	December
	455
	580
	~


Data is management information only, correct as at 20/11/2025 and subject to change.


2. The number of SARs completed within the statutory one month deadline, and the number completed within:
· 1 - 3 months
· 3 - 6 months
· Over 6 months
· Still outstanding (as of the date of this FOI)
Unfortunately, it would cost more than the FOI threshold of £600 to process your request and I am therefore refusing to do so in terms of section 12(1) of the Act.
Police Scotland do not record information on the number of days taken to respond to a SAR.
Compliance with SAR deadlines is calculated based on a deadline date field and a closed date field.
We do record the received date of the SAR, but more often than not, the actual date of validity will be later than this, mainly due to the necessary identification documents not being provided at the outset or clarification being sought.
We do not record the date at which a SAR becomes valid, and we are therefore unable to collate turnaround times, other than by reviewing the circumstances of each SAR individually.
You should also note that it is possible to extend the deadline of a SAR by up to two months. 
To be of assistance, I can provide you with our overall compliance figures, which represent the percentage of SARs responded to within the statutory deadline.
	 Year
	Quarter 1
	Quarter 2
	Quarter 3
	Quarter 4

	2023
	94%
	94%
	82%
	77%

	2024
	67%
	45%
	47%
	58%

	2025
	66%
	52%
	38%
	 ~





3. The longest delay recorded between receiving a SAR and issuing a response since January 2023.
A request received in March 2023 was responded to in December 2024 - that is the longest recorded delay recorded for a SAR response since January 2023.

4. Any internal or external audits, assessments, or reviews carried out since January 2023 regarding delays or compliance issues in Police Scotland’s SAR handling.
In October 2025, a review report was issued by the Police Scotland Risk, Assurance and Inspection Team based on the following terms of reference:
· Review SAR policies and procedures. 
· Assess the administrative process and impact of legislative timescales for SARs. 
· To consider good practice through benchmarking to identify potential solutions which support the SAR process. 
· Produce a factual assurance report outlining any recommendations or improvement opportunities identified. 
I am refusing to provide you with a copy of the report in terms of section 16(1) of the Act on the basis that the exemption outlined at section 30(c) of the Act applies - prejudice to the effective conduct of public affairs.
Publication of the report is very recent, and it remains under consideration by the relevant management team at this time, pending sharing with the wider team and action being taken as regards the various recommendations.
Whilst there is a public interest in terms of accountability and public awareness as regards how Police Scotland is managing its legislative SAR obligations, it cannot be in the public interest for reviews to be publicly disclosed before such time that they have been fully considered and actioned by the relevant management team. 
To be of assistance, I can also advise you that data regarding SAR compliance is shared with the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) monthly, via the Force Data Protection Officer.



5. A copy of any internal policy documents, guidance, or memos issued to SAR handling staff that discuss:
· Delays in SAR processing
· Communications with applicants regarding delays
· Changes in published timelines for expected SAR responses (e.g. the shift from 6 to 9 months in expected wait time)
The information sought is not held by Police Scotland and section 17 of the Act applies.
There are two actions/ decisions that would fall within the general scope of your request, but neither was the subject of policy/ guidance/ memo etc., with updates to staff being primarily delivered at team meetings.
Police Scotland no longer responds to ‘chase up’ emails from SAR applicants.  
To be of assistance, I can advise you that the rationale for the decision was resource.
Contacting all individual SAR applicants would be a significantly time-consuming exercise, which would divert resource from researching and responding to SARs more promptly.
The 9 month backlog message was added to the force website on 10 July 2025.
Prior to that, and since 22 January 2025, the website referred to a 6 month backlog.
Prior to that there was no information online about backlogs/ wait-times.
To be of assistance, I can advise you that the rationale for the decision to include that information was to better inform applicants as to the current situation.
Police Scotland has experienced an increase of more than 60% in SARs received over the past four years alone.
Unfortunately, that means that some SARs have not been responded to within a calendar month, as per the legislation.
Please be assured that our colleagues in Data Protection are working to respond to SARs as quickly as possible.

If you require any further assistance, please contact us quoting the reference above.
You can request a review of this response within the next 40 working days by email or by letter (Information Management - FOI, Police Scotland, Clyde Gateway, 2 French Street, Dalmarnock, G40 4EH).  Requests must include the reason for your dissatisfaction.
If you remain dissatisfied following our review response, you can appeal to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner (OSIC) within 6 months - online, by email or by letter (OSIC, Kinburn Castle, Doubledykes Road, St Andrews, KY16 9DS).
Following an OSIC appeal, you can appeal to the Court of Session on a point of law only. 
This response will be added to our Disclosure Log in seven days' time.
Every effort has been taken to ensure our response is as accessible as possible. 
If you require this response to be provided in an alternative format, please let us know.
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