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Freedom of Information Response
Our reference:  FOI 25-1859
Responded to:  20 November 2025


Your recent request for information is replicated below, together with our response.
I am writing to request, under the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002, to request the following information from Police Scotland, pertaining to the following road:- Weirston Road, Kilwinning between its junctions with the B785 and the Corsehill, with a timescale of the last 10 years. I am requesting the following information: -
1. The number of Road Traffic Accidents, including the causation and age of drivers.
2. The number of fatalities, including the causation and age of the drivers.
3. The number of non-fatal accidents, including causation and age of the drivers.
Please note that a reportable collision is defined at section 170 of the Road Traffic Act 1988 and describes the legal responsibility on those drivers involved to report the matter to the police.  Where those involved exchange personal details, there is no legal requirement to report a collision to the police, and this applies particularly to non-injury collisions.
As such, there may have been other collisions at the location specified in your request, which were not reported to Police Scotland, or which were reported, but did not require a collision report to be created.  Any such incidents will therefore not be included within the data.
A search of Road Traffic Collisions (RTCs) at Weirston Road, confirmed that there were 3 RTCs recorded with 3 casualties, for the period of your request.
Of which, 2 were recorded with collision severity ‘Serious’ and 1 ‘Slight’. Zero fatal accidents were recorded. Two of the drivers were 18 and one was 35.
Contributory factors include - Failed to Look Properly, Stationary/ Parked Vehicle & Careless/ Reckless/ In a hurry (D/R).

NB: All statistics are provisional and should be treated as management information. All data have been extracted from Police Scotland systems and are correct as of 02/09/2025.
Specified areas have been selected using the Ordnance Survey National Geographic Database (OS NGD). A 30metre buffer was placed on the selected area to return relevant records. 
On the 12th June 2019, CRaSH was implemented within D Division. On the 3rd July 2019, CRaSH was implemented across the other Police Divisions within Police Scotland. CRaSH replaced the existing procedures for recording Road Traffic Collisions.	
Data is subject to change and will be updated on the next extract of data from CRaSH on 3rd September 2025.

4. The number of total speeding offences and the age of the drivers.	
5. The number of drivers reported to the Procurator Fiscal in relation to a speeding offence.
In response to your request, we have carried out checks on our crime recording system, UNIFI, for Speeding offence data on Weirston Road, Ayrshire from 01/01/2015-31/07/2025 (inclusive). These checks returned zero records.
	
6. The number of drivers issued with a fixed penalty ticket in relation to a speeding offence.
In respect of speeding offences where Conditional Offers of Fixed Penalty Notice (COFPNs) were issued, figures are provided in the table below for period 01/01/2022-31/05/2025 (inclusive).
Data is taken from a live system which is subject to change and correct as of 20/06/2025. 
Data for the period prior to 2022 is no longer held and section 17 of the Act therefore applies. In accordance with our Record Retention SOP these records are held for 3 years plus current year only.
	Location
	Offence Code
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Bridgend Lane
	303.001 - Speeding In 30mph Zone
	0
	0
	3
	0

	Old Glasgow Road
	303.001 - Speeding In 30mph Zone
	5
	8
	8
	0

	Weirston Road
	303.001 - Speeding In 30mph Zone
	0
	0
	0
	0

	B778
	303.001 - Speeding In 30mph Zone
	0
	1
	1
	0


Data was extracted for locations Bridgend Lane, Old Glasgow Road, Weirston Road & B778, within Kilwinning area.
303.001 was the only speeding offence recorded at the locations specified.

7. The number of drivers reported under Section 2 of the Road Traffic Act 1988 and the age of the drivers.
8. The number of drivers reported under Section 3 of the Road Traffic Act 1988 and the age of the drivers.
Crimes in Scotland are recorded in accordance with the Scottish Government Justice Department (SGJD) offence classifications. 
We have progressed this part of your request for Dangerous/ Careless Driving offences and details are provided in the two tables below for Recorded & Detected Group 8 (Road Traffic related) offences.
Detected crimes are those where an accused has been identified and there exists a sufficiency of evidence under Scots Law to justify consideration of criminal proceedings.
In relation to age of the driver accused from those recorded/ detected crimes below, I can confirm they were (where an accused recorded):
24 yrs, 35 yrs, 56 yrs & 74 yrs.
Recorded Group 8 (Road Traffic related) crimes which occurred at Weirston Road, Ayrshire from 01/01/2015-31/07/2025 (inclusive).
	Crime Category
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Danger-ous Driving Offences
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0

	Driving Carelessly
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1

	Driving Under the Influence
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	0
	3
	1

	Other Group 8 Offences
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	1
	0

	Unlawful Use of Motor Vehicle
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	2
	0

	Total
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	1
	7
	2



Detected Group 8 (Road Traffic related) crimes which occurred at Weirston Road, Ayrshire from 01/01/2015-31/07/2025 (inclusive).
	Crime Category
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Danger-ous Driving Offences
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0

	Driving Carelessly
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1

	Driving Under the Influence
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	0
	3
	1

	Other Group 8 Offences
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0

	Unlawful Use of Motor Vehicle
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	2
	0

	Total
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	0
	7
	2


All statistics are provisional and should be treated as management information. All data have been extracted from Police Scotland systems and are correct as at 27/08/2025. 
Recorded/ Detected Crimes were extracted using the Date Raised/ Detected and then mapped to the location based on the Grid East and Grid North.			
Specified areas have been selected using the Ordnance Survey National Geographic Database (OS NGD), a 30 meter buffer was placed around the OS Street Line.
Please note, only records with a Grid East and Grid North are plotted and selected.  Not all records have a Grid East and Grid North.	
	
9. The number of roadside speed checks conducted by Police Scotland.
The information sought is not held by Police Scotland and section 17 of the Act therefore applies. To explain, we do not keep a record of the number of speed checks carried out in any particular location other than when it is listed as one of our priority locations. Whilst this location has historically been a priority location, the details of this have since weeded from the system as per our Record Retention SOP.

10. The number of complaints received by Police Scotland in relation to speeding/motorists’ behaviour.
Figures are provided in the table below of Road Traffic related incidents recorded at Weirston Road, from period 21/01/2015-31/07/2025 (inclusive).
Having reviewed the incident reports for the below, I can confirm that 3 related to complaints of speeding and 9 related to complaints of a motorist's behaviour.
	Initial Incident Type
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2023
	2024
	2025

	TR-41: Road Traffic Collision
	0
	1
	1
	0
	0
	2
	2
	0
	2
	0

	TR-43: Road Traffic Matter
	0
	1
	3
	1
	1
	4
	2
	2
	0
	0

	Total
	0
	2
	4
	1
	1
	6
	4
	2
	2
	0


All statistics are provisional and should be treated as management information. All data have been extracted from Police Scotland systems and are correct as of 27/08/2025.
Data extracted using incident's raised date and Disposal codes TR-41 (Road Traffic Collision) and TR-43 (Road Traffic Matter).					
Specified areas have been selected using the Ordnance Survey National Geographic Database (OS NGD). A 30 metre buffer was placed on the selected area(s) to return relevant records.
Please note, each record would need to be read to confirm the circumstances and location.
Error and transferred incidents have been removed.					

11. Any request Police Scotland have received from North Ayrshire Council in relation to motorists’ behaviour.
12. Any communication between Police Scotland and North Ayrshire Council with respect to speeding/motorists’ behaviour.
Unfortunately, I estimate that it would cost well in excess of the current FOI cost threshold of £600 to process your request.  I am therefore refusing to provide the information sought in terms of section 12(1) of the Act - Excessive Cost of Compliance.
By way of explanation, we contacted our Road Policing Team, however their independent searches returned no such information in relation to the specifics of your request. However, this should not be taken that such information is not held by Police Scotland as it is important to note that we are unable to carry out a force-wide search for correspondence. 
As such, the only way to provide an accurate response would be to conduct research across all Force Departments, within which everything exchanged internally (all documents, messages, emails across various specialised mailboxes etc.) with all Police Officers and all Police Staff would need to be analysed for relevancy to your request. Given the volume of material that would be required to be read, this exercise would far exceed the cost limit set out in the Fees Regulations. 
To be of assistance, I can advise that you may wish to contact North Ayrshire Council.

13. Outcome of any road safety meetings with North Ayrshire Council
Following an extensive search of Police Scotland systems we do not hold a record of such meetings or minutes, as such the information sought is not held by Police Scotland and section 17 of the Act therefore applies.

If you require any further assistance, please contact us quoting the reference above.
You can request a review of this response within the next 40 working days by email or by letter (Information Management - FOI, Police Scotland, Clyde Gateway, 2 French Street, Dalmarnock, G40 4EH).  Requests must include the reason for your dissatisfaction.
If you remain dissatisfied following our review response, you can appeal to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner (OSIC) within 6 months - online, by email or by letter (OSIC, Kinburn Castle, Doubledykes Road, St Andrews, KY16 9DS).
Following an OSIC appeal, you can appeal to the Court of Session on a point of law only. 
This response will be added to our Disclosure Log in seven days' time.
Every effort has been taken to ensure our response is as accessible as possible. 
If you require this response to be provided in an alternative format, please let us know.
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