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Freedom of Information Response
Our reference:  FOI 25-2873
Responded to:  06 October 2025


Your recent request for information is replicated below, together with our response.
This is a request under the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002.
For Scotland, for each year 2019 to the most recent full year (and year-to-date if held), please provide:
1. Total speeding offences detected.
1. Outcomes: numbers issued a Conditional Offer/Fixed Penalty (and accepted/paid), numbers reported to COPFS for prosecution, and (if held) resulting court fines totals/averages.
1. If readily available: split by detection method (safety camera vs officer), and by Police Division.
1. Any speed band breakdowns you hold (e.g., relative to the posted limit).
As noted in your request, speeding offences are captured by both safety cameras and Officers. 
For offences detected by Officers, I must advise the information sought is held by Police Scotland, but I am refusing to provide it in terms of section 16(1) of the Act on the basis that the section 25(1) exemption applies:
“Information which the applicant can reasonably obtain other than by requesting it […] is exempt information”.
The information sought is publicly available:
Crime data - Police Scotland 
In relation to the outcome of these offences, all crimes would have to be reviewed for relevance. I am therefore refusing to provide the information sought in terms of section 12(1) of the Act - Excessive Cost of Compliance.

[bookmark: _MailAutoSig]I can, however, provide some data in relation to offences detected by safety cameras, but, I must advise that Police Scotland does not hold all of the above requested information. 
In terms of Section 17 of the Act, this letter represents a formal notice that information is not held.
By way of explanation and in relation to Conditional Offers of Fixed Penalty and reports to the Crown and Procurator Fiscal Service, Police Scotland’s record retention policy for such data is 3 years plus the current year.  Accordingly, data prior to 2022 is no longer held.
Additionally in relation to court fines, the role of the police in Scotland, in relation to crimes and offences, is to investigate the circumstances and where sufficient evidence exists to then report the matter to the relevant Procurator Fiscal.  It is a matter for the Procurator Fiscal to decide on and to progress any prosecution through the courts. 
The disposal in relation to cases reported to the Procurator Fiscal is not routinely passed to the police, therefore, the Service do not hold the information requested in relation to court fines total/averages and in terms of Section 17 of the Act, this letter represents a formal notice that information is not held.
By way of assistance, I have listed below contact details for the Crown Office and Procurator Fiscals Service who may be able to assist you in this matter:
Crown Office, 25 Chambers Street, Edinburgh, EH1 1LA or via http://www.copfs.gov.uk/

Please note the following caveats relate to all tables below:
· Data provided here is for SCU offences only.
· Data is taken from a live system which is subject to change and correct as of 15/09/2025.
· The outcomes provided relate to the offences committed within the year specified, rather than by date of issue of the COFPN, for example.
· The speed bands have been grouped in 10mph increments/bands, the exception being the first 20mph above the speed limit. This is to obscure any potential to infer the enforcement threshold, which is information which is withheld.
· 2025 is Year To Date with all available/downloaded offences as of 15/09/2025.


	
	Scotland

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	65,931
	72,754
	79,352
	60,575

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	11,720

	
	COFPN Issued
	44,379
	48,058
	49,742
	32,022

	
	COFPN Paid
	37,338
	40,702
	42,954
	26,468

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	2,697

	
	Report to PF
	8,350
	10,773
	13,349
	7,221

	
	No Further Action
	20,243
	21,279
	23,049
	12,469

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	58,171
	64,091
	68,471
	52,429

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	2,742
	3,181
	3,404
	2,182

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	249
	251
	308
	301

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	55
	46
	45
	65

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	23
	13
	17
	26

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	4,691
	5,172
	7,107
	5,572










	

	A Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	10,280
	11,026
	11,475
	9,948

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	1,882

	
	COFPN Issued
	6,987
	7,302
	7,041
	5,171

	
	COFPN Paid
	5,864
	6,245
	6,121
	4,376

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	401

	
	Report to PF
	1,212
	1,626
	2,003
	1,250

	
	No Further Action
	3,204
	3,155
	3,351
	2,039

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	9,116
	9,712
	9,984
	8,543

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	561
	643
	656
	519

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	50
	49
	60
	66

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	14
	10
	6
	10

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	3
	2
	5
	9

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	536
	610
	764
	801









	
	C Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	4,166
	4,933
	10,479
	4,642

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	977

	
	COFPN Issued
	3,211
	3,733
	7,633
	2,951

	
	COFPN Paid
	2,758
	3,233
	6,630
	2,414

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	299

	
	Report to PF
	545
	705
	1,530
	425

	
	No Further Action
	863
	995
	2,319
	527

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	3,935
	4,605
	9,443
	4,359

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	159
	236
	619
	147

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	16
	16
	77
	21

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	0
	3
	3
	4

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	2
	1
	4
	0

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	54
	72
	333
	111










	
	D Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	9,517
	15,031
	9,254
	7,644

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	1,798

	
	COFPN Issued
	6,208
	8,396
	5,189
	3,438

	
	COFPN Paid
	5,167
	6,889
	4,398
	2,802

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	317

	
	Report to PF
	1,457
	1,891
	1,827
	1,254

	
	No Further Action
	2,893
	6,251
	3,029
	1,473

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	8,639
	12,921
	8,134
	6,797

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	463
	759
	490
	458

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	27
	53
	28
	43

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	6
	8
	1
	12

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	3
	6
	2
	2

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	379
	1,284
	599
	332










	
	E Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	7,569
	10,749
	10,601
	7,978

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	1,563

	
	COFPN Issued
	5,193
	7,573
	6,830
	4,044

	
	COFPN Paid
	4,486
	6,484
	5,964
	3,268

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	383

	
	Report to PF
	1,046
	1,603
	1,413
	672

	
	No Further Action
	2,037
	2,662
	3,224
	2,092

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	6,814
	9,969
	9,388
	6,697

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	228
	264
	254
	166

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	18
	32
	31
	30

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	7
	10
	6
	8

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	3
	2
	2
	3

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	499
	472
	920
	1,074










	
	G Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	14,731
	9,874
	17,170
	14,893

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	2,463

	
	COFPN Issued
	9,034
	5,570
	9,890
	8,337

	
	COFPN Paid
	7,481
	4,622
	8,424
	7,028

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	549

	
	Report to PF
	1,387
	1,385
	2,882
	1,664

	
	No Further Action
	5,863
	3,867
	5,864
	3,189

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	12,415
	7,591
	13,895
	12,969

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	447
	276
	389
	209

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	37
	28
	35
	53

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	10
	4
	9
	17

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	5
	0
	1
	5

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	1,817
	1,975
	2,841
	1,640










	
	J Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	3,927
	3,630
	3,396
	1,882

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	306

	
	COFPN Issued
	2,801
	2,712
	2,445
	1,059

	
	COFPN Paid
	2,410
	2,392
	2,174
	882

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	96

	
	Report to PF
	601
	531
	492
	142

	
	No Further Action
	916
	707
	730
	456

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	3,557
	3,302
	3,016
	1,501

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	190
	154
	199
	103

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	21
	13
	17
	15

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	8
	3
	8
	1

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	3
	0
	1
	5

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	148
	158
	155
	257










	
	K Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	1,608
	1,033
	1,792
	2,251

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	648

	
	COFPN Issued
	1,170
	763
	1,148
	1,103

	
	COFPN Paid
	997
	655
	977
	842

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	166

	
	Report to PF
	161
	144
	308
	215

	
	No Further Action
	450
	234
	507
	380

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	1,504
	965
	1,561
	1,981

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	29
	13
	22
	15

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	1
	3
	5
	15

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	0
	1
	2
	1

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	0
	0
	0
	1

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	74
	51
	202
	238










	L Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	66
	16
	737
	36

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	18

	
	COFPN Issued
	48
	12
	429
	12

	
	COFPN Paid
	41
	7
	358
	10

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	0

	
	Report to PF
	11
	6
	140
	4

	
	No Further Action
	14
	3
	239
	4

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	51
	12
	591
	29

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	5
	3
	27
	1

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	2
	1
	1
	2

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	2
	0
	0
	0

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	0
	0
	0
	0

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	6
	0
	118
	4










	
	N Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	2,600
	5,561
	6,437
	5,149

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	946

	
	COFPN Issued
	1,893
	3,842
	3,934
	2,764

	
	COFPN Paid
	1,657
	3,261
	3,504
	2,325

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	227

	
	Report to PF
	380
	1,072
	1,502
	910

	
	No Further Action
	563
	1,228
	1,431
	741

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	2,344
	5,099
	5,798
	4,587

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	149
	309
	436
	365

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	11
	11
	30
	27

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	2
	0
	5
	5

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	0
	0
	1
	0

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	94
	142
	167
	165









	
	P Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	2,510
	2,707
	2,789
	1,190

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	180

	
	COFPN Issued
	2,082
	2,133
	2,138
	845

	
	COFPN Paid
	1,700
	1,803
	1,815
	685

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	70

	
	Report to PF
	313
	421
	484
	127

	
	No Further Action
	497
	483
	490
	128

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	2,332
	2,483
	2,571
	1,127

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	103
	136
	133
	38

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	14
	14
	9
	3

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	0
	1
	3
	0

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	0
	0
	1
	0

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	61
	73
	72
	22










	
	Q Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	4,756
	3,139
	2,604
	2,659

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	438

	
	COFPN Issued
	2,851
	2,163
	1,188
	1,220

	
	COFPN Paid
	2,322
	1,768
	982
	974

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	90

	
	Report to PF
	616
	534
	326
	324

	
	No Further Action
	1,818
	837
	1,296
	833

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	3,925
	2,884
	1,732
	2,037

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	155
	59
	53
	87

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	22
	5
	4
	21

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	3
	4
	0
	3

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	3
	1
	0
	1

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	648
	186
	815
	510










	
	U Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	2,289
	1,892
	1,595
	1,880

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	316

	
	COFPN Issued
	1,457
	1,366
	1,051
	920

	
	COFPN Paid
	1,206
	1,131
	885
	750

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	72

	
	Report to PF
	256
	301
	273
	213

	
	No Further Action
	827
	460
	437
	529

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	1,852
	1,689
	1,434
	1,458

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	86
	80
	53
	49

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	9
	8
	4
	3

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	0
	0
	2
	4

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	1
	0
	0
	0

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	341
	115
	102
	366










	
	V Division

	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	Outcomes
	Speeding Offences
	1,912
	3,163
	1,023
	423

	
	Still Identifying Driver
	0
	0
	0
	185

	
	COFPN Issued
	1,444
	2,493
	826
	158

	
	COFPN Paid
	1,249
	2,212
	722
	112

	
	COFPN Awaiting Payment
	0
	0
	0
	27

	
	Report to PF
	365
	554
	169
	21

	
	No Further Action
	298
	397
	132
	78

	Offence Speeds
	1-20mph above the limit
	1,687
	2,859
	924
	344

	
	21-30mph above the limit
	167
	249
	73
	25

	
	31-40mph above the limit
	21
	18
	7
	2

	
	41-50mph above the limit
	3
	2
	0
	0

	
	51mph+ above the limit
	0
	1
	0
	0

	
	Unknown (e.g. not recorded)
	34
	34
	19
	52



If you require any further assistance, please contact us quoting the reference above.
You can request a review of this response within the next 40 working days by email or by letter (Information Management - FOI, Police Scotland, Clyde Gateway, 2 French Street, Dalmarnock, G40 4EH).  Requests must include the reason for your dissatisfaction.
If you remain dissatisfied following our review response, you can appeal to the Office of the Scottish Information Commissioner (OSIC) within 6 months - online, by email or by letter (OSIC, Kinburn Castle, Doubledykes Road, St Andrews, KY16 9DS).
Following an OSIC appeal, you can appeal to the Court of Session on a point of law only. 
This response will be added to our Disclosure Log in seven days' time.
Every effort has been taken to ensure our response is as accessible as possible. 
If you require this response to be provided in an alternative format, please let us know.
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